



TOWN OF SMITHFIELD

BID TAB

RESIDENTIAL REFUSE/RECYCLABLES COLLECTION SERVICE(S) BID OPENING: MARCH 1, 2013 @ 10:00AM

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Items	Bid Amounts	Bid Amounts	Bid Amounts
			MTG DISPOSAL, LLC 19 INDUSTRIAL WAY SEEKONK, MA 02771	PATRIOT DISPOSAL CO., INC 2208 PLAINFIELD PIKE JOHNSTON, RI 02919	WASTE MANAGEMENT 26 PATRIOT PLACE SUITE 300 FOXBORO, MA 02035
1A	REFUSE COLLECTION/TRADITIONAL	3 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2016	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1B	REFUSE COLLECTION/TRADITIONAL	5 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2018	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1C	REFUSE COLLECTION/TRADITIONAL	7 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2020	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1D	REFUSE COLLECTION/FULLY-AUTOMATED	5 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2018	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1E	REFUSE COLLECTION/FULLY-AUTOMATED	7 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2020	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2A	RECYCLABLES COLLECTION/TRADITIONAL	3 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2016	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2B	RECYCLABLES COLLECTION/TRADITIONAL	5 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2018	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2C	RECYCLABLES COLLECTION/TRADITIONAL	7 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2020	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2D	RECYCLABLES COLLECTION/FULLY-AUTOMATED	5 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2018	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2E	RECYCLABLES COLLECTION/FULLY-AUTOMATED	7 YEARS, JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2020	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3A	REFUSE & RECYCLABLES COMBINATION/TRADITIONAL - 3 YEARS	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	979,000	NO BID	NO BID
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	1,003,000		
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	1,029,000		
		3-YEAR TOTAL	\$3,011,000		
3B	REFUSE & RECYCLABLES COMBINATION/TRADITIONAL - 5 YEARS	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	979,000	NO BID	1,518,000
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	1,003,000		1,564,000
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	1,029,000		1,611,000
		YEAR 4 - July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017	1,054,000		1,659,000
		YEAR 5 - July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018	1,081,000		1,709,000
		5-YEAR TOTAL	\$5,146,000		\$8,061,000
3C	REFUSE & RECYCLABLES COMBINATION/TRADITIONAL - 7 YEARS	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	979,000	NO BID	1,478,000
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	1,003,000		1,523,000
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	1,029,000		1,568,000
		YEAR 4 - July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017	1,054,000		1,615,000
		YEAR 5 - July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018	1,081,000		1,664,000
		YEAR 6 - July 1, 2018 - June 30, 2019	1,081,000		1,714,000
		YEAR 7 - July 1, 2019 - June 30, 2020	1,081,000		1,765,000
		7-YEAR TOTAL	\$7,308,000		\$11,327,000
3D	REFUSE & RECYCLABLES COMBINATION/FULLY-AUTOMATED (TOTERS) - 5 YEARS	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	899,000	1,065,000	1,158,000
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	921,000	1,100,000	1,193,000
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	945,000	1,135,000	1,228,000
		YEAR 4 - July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017	968,000	1,170,000	1,265,000
		YEAR 5 - July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018	992,000	1,205,000	1,303,000
		5-YEAR TOTAL	\$4,725,000	\$5,675,000	\$6,147,000
3E	REFUSE & RECYCLABLES COMBINATION/FULLY-AUTOMATED (TOTERS) - 7 YEARS	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	899,000	1,065,000	1,126,000
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	921,000	1,100,000	1,160,000
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	945,000	1,135,000	1,195,000
		YEAR 4 - July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017	968,000	1,170,000	1,230,000
		YEAR 5 - July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018	992,000	1,205,000	1,267,000
		YEAR 6 - July 1, 2018 - June 30, 2019	992,000	1,240,000	1,305,000
		YEAR 7 - July 1, 2019 - June 30, 2020	992,000	1,275,000	1,344,000
		7-YEAR TOTAL	\$6,709,000	\$8,190,000	\$8,627,000
4A	NATURAL DISASTER / SEVERE WEATHER CLEANUP (PRICE PER HOUR / PER TRUCK)	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	85.00	225.00	175.00
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	87.00	225.00	180.00
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	89.00	225.00	185.00
4B	NATURAL DISASTER / SEVERE WEATHER CLEANUP (PRICE PER HOUR / PER TRUCK)	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	85.00	225.00	175.00
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	87.00	225.00	180.00
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	89.00	225.00	185.00
		YEAR 4 - July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017	92.00	225.00	191.00
		YEAR 5 - July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018	94.00	225.00	197.00
4C	NATURAL DISASTER / SEVERE WEATHER CLEANUP (PRICE PER HOUR / PER TRUCK)	YEAR 1 - July 1, 2013 - June 30, 2014	85.00	225.00	175.00
		YEAR 2 - July 1, 2014 - June 30, 2015	87.00	225.00	180.00
		YEAR 3 - July 1, 2015 - June 30, 2016	89.00	225.00	185.00
		YEAR 4 - July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2017	92.00	225.00	191.00
		YEAR 5 - July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018	94.00	225.00	197.00
		YEAR 6 - July 1, 2018 - June 30, 2019	96.00	225.00	203.00
		YEAR 7 - July 1, 2019 - June 30, 2020	99.00	225.00	209.00
5A	BID DEDUCT - HOUSEHOLD APPLIANCES/ELECTRONICS	JULY 1, 2013 - JUNE 30, 2014	(\$12,000)	\$0	(\$15,600)

REFERRED TO THE EVALUATION COMMITTEE FOR REVIEW AND FUTURE RECOMMENDATION WILL BE FORWARDED TO THE TOWN COUNCIL FOR APPROVAL.